BID DATE: NOVEMBER 10, 2021, 10:00 AM
ENGINEER: Richard Gardella, PE, PP, CME, CPWM

BID SUMMARY FOR:

IMPROVEMENTS TO HANCE ROAD AND COONEY TERRACE - PHASE 2
BOROUGH OF FAIR HAVEN

Earle Asphalt Company Fernandes Construction Fiore Paving Company, Inc. L&L Paving Company, Inc. Lima Charlie Construction
NAME AND ADDRESS PO Box 556 25 Stonegate Drive 4 Fiore Court 89 Yellowbrook Road 2 Hance Avenue
OF BIDDER Farmingdale, NJ 07727 Monroe, New Jersey 08831 Oceanport, NJ 07757 Farmingdale, NJ 07727 Tinton Falls, NJ 07724
732-308-1113 732-266-4816 732-870-3432 732-922-6303 732-955-8300
djones@earleco.com gmfernandesconstruction@gmail.com fiorepaving@aol.com rfoggia@llpaving.com sachinpatel@leafgroupnj.com
Item Description Units Qty Unit Price Item Total Bid Total Err. Unit Price Item Total Bid Total Err. Unit Price Item Total Bid Total Err. Unit Price Item Total Bid Total Err. Unit Price Item Total Bid Total Err.
1 |CLEARING SITE LS 1 S 46,681.68 [ S  46,681.68 $46,681.68 $10,000.00 [ $  10,000.00 | $  10,000.00 $20,000.00 [ $  20,000.00 | $  20,000.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $71,446.00 | $  71,446.00 [ $  71,446.00
2 |PRE-CONSTRUCTION VIDEO LS 1 S 250.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 250.00 $0.01|$ 0.01 $0.01 $3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 $3,000.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $250.00 | $ 250.00 $250.00
3 |INLET FILTER, TYPE 1 SF 30 S 10.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00 $0.01 | $ 0.30 $0.30 $0.01|$ 0.30 $0.30 NO BID SUBMITTED $1.00 | $ 30.00 $30.00
4 |BREAKAWAY BARRICADE WITH SIGN UN 8 S 0.01]$ 0.08 | $ 0.08 $0.01|$ 0.08 $0.08 $0.01|$ 0.08 $0.08 NO BID SUBMITTED $1.00 | $ 8.00 $8.00
5 |CONSTRUCTION SIGNS SF 25 S 15.00 | $ 375.00 | $ 375.00 $0.01 | $ 0.25 $0.25 $0.01|$ 0.25 $0.25 NO BID SUBMITTED $25.00 | $ 625.00 $625.00
6 |DRUM UN 10 S 0.01]$ 0.10]$ 0.10 $0.01|$ 0.10 $0.10 $0.01|$ 0.10 $0.10 NO BID SUBMITTED $1.00 | $ 10.00 $10.00
7 |TRAFFIC CONE UN 40 S 0.01]$ 040 |$ 0.40 $0.01 | $ 0.40 $0.40 $0.01|$ 0.40 $0.40 NO BID SUBMITTED $1.00 | $ 40.00 $40.00
8 |TRAFFIC DIRECTOR, FLAGGER HR 400 S 55.00 | $ 22,000.00 | $ 22,000.00 S 55.00 | $ 22,000.00 $22,000.00 S 55.00 | $ 22,000.00 $22,000.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $ 55.00 | $ 22,000.00 $22,000.00
9 |REMOVE AND RESET BRICK PAVER WALKWAY SY 15 S 100.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 $75.00 | $ 1,125.00 $1,125.00 $150.00 | $ 2,250.00 $2,250.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $150.00 | $ 2,250.00 $2,250.00
10 |RECONSTRUCT MASONRY STEPS LS 1 S 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 $500.00 | $ 500.00 $500.00 $9,000.00 | $ 9,000.00 $9,000.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 $2,500.00
11 |CONCRETE DRIVEWAY, REINFORCED, 6" THICK SY 35 S 130.00 | $ 4,550.00 | $ 4,550.00 $75.00 | $ 2,625.00 $2,625.00 $150.00 | $ 5,250.00 $5,250.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $125.00 | $ 4,375.00 $4,375.00
12 |BELGIUM BLOCK DRIVEWAY sY 10 S 200.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 $100.00 | $ 1,000.00 $1,000.00 $75.00 | $ 750.00 $750.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $150.00 | $ 1,500.00 $1,500.00
13 |REMOVE AND RESET BRICK PAVER WALKWAY NG 20 S 125.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 $75.00 | $ 1,500.00 $1,500.00 $200.00 | $ 4,000.00 $4,000.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $150.00 | $ 3,000.00 $3,000.00
14 |8"X18" CONCRETE VERTICAL CURB LF 1,525 S 33.00 | $ 50,325.00 | $ 50,325.00 $28.00 | $ 42,700.00 $42,700.00 $35.00 | $ 53,375.00 $53,375.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $35.00 | $ 53,375.00 $53,375.00
15 |GRANITE CURB LF 15 S 45.00 | $ 675.00 | $ 675.00 $30.00 | S 450.00 $450.00 $50.00 | $ 750.00 $750.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $75.00 | $ 1,125.00 $1,125.00
16 [HOT MIX ASPHALT DRIVEWAY, 2" THICK sY 100 $ 50.00|$  500000|$ 500000 $21.00| $  2,100.00 $2,100.00 $50.00 | $  5,000.00 $5,000.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $50.00 | $  5,000.00 $5,000.00
17 |GRAVEL DRIVEWAY SY 15 S 30.50 | $ 45750 [ $ 457.50 $0.01 | $ 0.15 $0.15 $20.00 | $ 300.00 $300.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $40.00 | $ 600.00 $600.00
18 |HOT MIX ASPHALT MILLING, 0"-3" DEPTH sy 5,800 $ 3.83($ 22504.00|$  22,504.00 $4.00 | $  23,200.00 $23,200.00 $4.00 | $  23,200.00 $23,200.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $2.50 | $  14,500.00 $14,500.00
19 |HOT MIX ASPHALT MILLING, VARIABLE DEPTH SY 300 S 388 1,164.00 | $ 1,164.00 $5.00 | $ 1,500.00 $1,500.00 $6.00 | $ 1,800.00 $1,800.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $5.00 | $ 1,500.00 $1,500.00
20 |SUPERPAVE HOT MIX ASPHALT SURFACE COURSE, 2" THICK| TON 750 $ 80.00 | $ 60,000.00 [ $  60,000.00 $106.00 | $  79,500.00 $79,500.00 $100.00 | $  75,000.00 $75,000.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $100.00 | $  75,000.00 $75,000.00
21 |HOT MIX ASPHALT BASE COURSE TON 75 S 69.25| $ 519375 | $ 5,193.75 $106.00 | S 7,950.00 $7,950.00 $200.00 | $ 15,000.00 $15,000.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $125.00 | $ 9,375.00 $9,375.00
22 |DENSE GRADED AGGREGATE TON 50 $ 10.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 500.00 $0.01|$ 0.50 $0.50 $30.00 | $ 1,500.00 $1,500.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $10.00 | $ 500.00 $500.00
23 |TACK COAT GAL 400 S 0.01]S$ 4.00|$ 4.00 $0.01 | $ 4.00 $4.00 $5.00 | $ 2,000.00 $2,000.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $1.00 | S 400.00 $400.00
24 |RESET EXISTING CASTING UN 12 $ 100.00 [ $  1,200.00 [ $  1,200.00 $300.00 | $  3,600.00 $3,600.00 $400.00 | $  4,800.00 $4,800.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $350.00 | $  4,200.00 $4,200.00
25 |RESET WATER VALVE BOX UN 6 S 0.01]S$ 0.06 | $ 0.06 $0.01 | $ 0.06 $0.06 $25.00 | $ 150.00 $150.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $25.00 | $ 150.00 $150.00
26 |RESET GAS VALVE BOX UN 6 S 0.01]S$ 0.06 | $ 0.06 $0.01|$ 0.06 $0.06 $25.00 | $ 150.00 $150.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $25.00 | $ 150.00 $150.00
27 |INLET, TYPE 'B' UN 9 S 3,600.00 | $ 32,400.00 | $ 32,400.00 $5,000.00 | $ 45,000.00 $45,000.00 $4,000.00 | $ 36,000.00 $36,000.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $4,500.00 | $  40,500.00 $40,500.00
28 |MANHOLE UN 2 $ 4,300.00 | $ 8,600.00 | $ 8,600.00 $5,000.00 | $  10,000.00 $10,000.00 $600.00 | $ 1,200.00 $1,200.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $4,500.00 | $ 9,000.00 $9,000.00
29 |RECONSTRUCT MANHOLE UN 2 S 980.00 | $ 1,960.00 | $ 1,960.00 $750.00 | $ 1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 $4,000.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $1,200.00 | $ 2,400.00 $2,400.00
30 |MANHOLE FRAME AND COVER UN 4 $ 460.00 | $ 1,840.00 | $ 1,840.00 $700.00 | $ 2,800.00 $2,800.00 $1,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 $4,000.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $1,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 $4,000.00
31 |HDPE PIPE, 15" DIAMETER LF 140 S 115.50 | $ 16,170.00 | $ 16,170.00 $3264 | $ 4,569.60 $4,569.60 $90.00 | $ 12,600.00 $12,600.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $125.00 | $ 17,500.00 $17,500.00
32 |HYDRO-JETTING STORM DRAIN PIPE, 24" DIAMETER LF 1,750 $ 365 S 6,387.50 | $ 6,387.50 $10.00 [ $  17,500.00 $17,500.00 $3.40 | S 5,950.00 $5,950.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $15.00 [ $  26,250.00 $26,250.00
33 |REGULATORY AND WARNING SIGN SF 50 S 42251 S 2,112.50 | $ 2,112.50 $32.00 | $ 1,600.00 $1,600.00 $50.00 | $ 2,500.00 $2,500.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $40.00 | S 2,000.00 $2,000.00
34 |TRAFFIC STRIPES, THERMOPLASTIC 4" LF 250 $ 445 s 1,112.50 | $ 1,112.50 $12.00 | $ 3,000.00 $3,000.00 $11.00 | $ 2,750.00 $2,750.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $4.50 | $ 1,125.00 $1,125.00
35 |EXCAVATION, TEST PIT cy 10 S 25.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 250.00 $0.01|$ 0.10 $0.10 $200.00 | $ 2,000.00 $2,000.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $75.00 | $ 750.00 $750.00
36 |TREE REMOVAL, UP TO 12" CAL. DBH UN 1 $ 750.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 750.00 $600.00 | $ 600.00 $600.00 $2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 $2,000.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $600.00 | $ 600.00 $600.00
37 |TREE REMOVAL, OVER 12" CAL. DBH UN 1 S 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 $1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00 $1,200.00 $3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 $3,000.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 $2,000.00
38 [TOPSOILING (4” THICK) Sy 1,110 $ 5.00 [ $ 5,550.00 | $ 5,550.00 $10.00 [ $  11,100.00 $11,100.00 $6.00 | $ 6,660.00 $6,660.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $6.00 | $ 6,660.00 $6,660.00
39 |SODDING NG 1,100 S 500 $ 5,500.00 | $ 5,500.00 $3.00 | $ 3,300.00 $3,300.00 $10.00 | $ 11,000.00 $11,000.00 NO BID SUBMITTED $7.00 | $ 7,700.00 $7,700.00
Total Base Bid $ 313,313.13 | $ 313,313.13 $ 301,925.61 [ $ 301,925.61 $ 342,936.13 [ $ 342,936.13 = $ o $ 394,394.00 | $ 394,394.00
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BID DATE: NOVEMBER 10, 2021, 10:00 AM

ENGINEER: Richard Gardella, PE, PP, CME, CPWM

BID SUMMARY FOR:

IMPROVEMENTS TO HANCE ROAD AND COONEY TERRACE - PHASE 2
BOROUGH OF FAIR HAVEN

S. Brothers Inc.

Seacoast, Inc.

NAME AND ADDRESS Mailing: P.O. Box 317 South River, NJ 088882 15 Addington Ct
OF BIDDER Physical: 16 Sobechko Road Manalapan, NJ 07726 East Brunswick, NJ 08816-5300
732-446-3390 732-238-6963
sbrothers1@hotmail.com carla@seacoastinc.com
Item Description Units Qty Unit Price Item Total Bid Total Err. Unit Price Item Total Bid Total Err.

1 |CLEARING SITE LS 1 $47,500.00 | $  47,500.00 | $  47,500.00 $54,000.00 [ $  54,000.00 | $  54,000.00
2 |PRE-CONSTRUCTION VIDEO LS 1 $1,500.00 [ $  1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 [ $  1,500.00 $1,500.00
3 |INLET FILTER, TYPE 1 SF 30 $1.00 | $ 30.00 $30.00 $0.01|$ 0.30 $0.30
4 |BREAKAWAY BARRICADE WITH SIGN UN 8 $1.00 | $ 8.00 $8.00 $0.01 [ $ 0.08 $0.08
5 |CONSTRUCTION SIGNS SF 25 $1.00| $ 25.00 $25.00 $0.01 ¢ 0.25 $0.25
6 |DRUM UN 10 $1.00 [ $ 10.00 $10.00 $0.01 | $ 0.10 $0.10
7 | TRAFFIC CONE UN 40 $1.00 | $ 40.00 $40.00 $0.01 [ $ 0.40 $0.40
8 |TRAFFIC DIRECTOR, FLAGGER HR 400 $ 55.00 [ $  22,000.00 $22,000.00 $ 55.00 [ $  22,000.00 $22,000.00
9 |REMOVE AND RESET BRICK PAVER WALKWAY sy 15 $80.00 | $  1,200.00 $1,200.00 $220.00 | $  3,300.00 $3,300.00
10 |RECONSTRUCT MASONRY STEPS Ls 1 $1,000.00 [ $  1,000.00 $1,000.00 $4,750.00 [ $  4,750.00 $4,750.00
11 [CONCRETE DRIVEWAY, REINFORCED, 6" THICK sy 35 $100.00 | $  3,500.00 $3,500.00 $100.00 | $  3,500.00 $3,500.00
12 [BELGIUM BLOCK DRIVEWAY sy 10 $120.00 | $  1,200.00 $1,200.00 $300.00 | $  3,000.00 $3,000.00
13 [REMOVE AND RESET BRICK PAVER WALKWAY sy 20 $80.00 | $  1,600.00 $1,600.00 $220.00 | $  4,400.00 $4,400.00
14 |8"X18" CONCRETE VERTICAL CURB LF 1,525 $32.00 | $  48,800.00 $48,800.00 $32.00 | $  48,800.00 $48,800.00
15 |GRANITE CURB LF 15 $35.00 | $ 525.00 $525.00 $40.00 | $ 600.00 $600.00
16 |HOT MIX ASPHALT DRIVEWAY, 2” THICK Sy 100 $25.00 [ $ 2,500.00 $2,500.00 $54.00 | $ 5,400.00 $5,400.00
17 |GRAVEL DRIVEWAY sy 15 $1.00 [ $ 15.00 $15.00 $54.00 | $ 810.00 $810.00
18 |HOT MIX ASPHALT MILLING, 0"-3" DEPTH sy 5,800 $4.50 [ $  26,100.00 $26,100.00 $3.75|$  21,750.00 $21,750.00
19 [HOT MIX ASPHALT MILLING, VARIABLE DEPTH sy 300 $450 [ $  1,350.00 $1,350.00 $4.50 [ $  1,350.00 $1,350.00
20 |SUPERPAVE HOT MIX ASPHALT SURFACE COURSE, 2" THICK| TON 750 $98.00 | $  73,500.00 $73,500.00 $90.00 | $  67,500.00 $67,500.00
21 |HOT MIX ASPHALT BASE COURSE TON 75 $60.00 | $  4,500.00 $4,500.00 $150.00 | $  11,250.00 $11,250.00
22 |DENSE GRADED AGGREGATE TON 50 $1.00 [ $ 50.00 $50.00 $34.00| $  1,700.00 $1,700.00
23 |TACK COAT GAL 400 $5.00 [ $  2,000.00 $2,000.00 $3.00 [ $  1,200.00 $1,200.00
24 |RESET EXISTING CASTING UN 12 $1.00 [ $ 12.00 $12.00 $250.00 | $  3,000.00 $3,000.00
25 |RESET WATER VALVE BOX UN 6 $1.00 | $ 6.00 $6.00 $50.00 | $ 300.00 $300.00
26 |RESET GAS VALVE BOX UN 6 $1.00 | $ 6.00 $6.00 $50.00 | $ 300.00 $300.00
27 |INLET, TYPE 'B' UN 9 $4,000.00 [ $  36,000.00 $36,000.00 $5,000.00 [ $  45,000.00 $45,000.00
28 |MANHOLE UN 2 $5,800.00 [ $  11,600.00 $11,600.00 $5,500.00 [ $  11,000.00 $11,000.00
29 |RECONSTRUCT MANHOLE UN 2 $1,000.00 [ $  2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 [ $  4,000.00 $4,000.00
30 |MANHOLE FRAME AND COVER UN 4 $800.00 | $  3,200.00 $3,200.00 $1,250.00 [ $  5,000.00 $5,000.00
31 |HDPE PIPE, 15" DIAMETER LF 140 $200.00 | $  28,000.00 $28,000.00 $200.00 | $  28,000.00 $28,000.00
32 |HYDRO-JETTING STORM DRAIN PIPE, 24" DIAMETER LF 1,750 $20.00 [ $  35,000.00 $35,000.00 $15.00 [ $  26,250.00 $26,250.00
33 |REGULATORY AND WARNING SIGN SF 50 $60.00 | $  3,000.00 $3,000.00 $36.00 | $  1,800.00 $1,800.00
34 |TRAFFIC STRIPES, THERMOPLASTIC 4" LF 250 $6.00| $  1,500.00 $1,500.00 $4.00 [ $  1,000.00 $1,000.00
35 |EXCAVATION, TEST PIT cy 10 $1.00 [ $ 10.00 $10.00 $25.00 | $ 250.00 $250.00
36 |TREE REMOVAL, UP TO 12" CAL. DBH UN 1 $1,600.00 | $  1,600.00 $1,600.00 $2,000.00 [ $  2,000.00 $2,000.00
37 |TREE REMOVAL, OVER 12" CAL. DBH UN 1 $1,800.00 [ $  1,800.00 $1,800.00 $5,000.00 [ $  5,000.00 $5,000.00
38 [TOPSOILING (4” THICK) sy 1,110 $4.00 [ $  4,440.00 $4,440.00 $2.00($  2,220.00 $2,220.00
39 [SODDING sy 1,100 $11.00 | $  12,100.00 $12,100.00 $2.00 [ $  2,200.00 $2,200.00

Total Base Bid $ 379,227.00 | $ 379,227.00 $ 394,131.13 | $ 394,131.13
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